
CHAPTER 5 – BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS 
 

Section 5-78. International Fuel Gas Code – Adopted and Amended. 

(A) A certain document, one copy of which is on file in the City Clerk’s Office of the 
City of Peoria, being marked and designated as “International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition,” 
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted, as amended herein, as the Fuel 
Gas Code of the City of Peoria. 

 
(B) The International Fuel Gas Code, 2012 Edition, is amended as follows:  

 
(1) Chapter 1, “Scope and Administration” is hereby amended as follows: 

 
101.1 Title.  Insert the words “City of Peoria” in the name of jurisdiction. 

 
101.2 Scope.  Amend as follows by adding: Any references to the ICC Electrical 
Code shall be deleted and the words “Electrical Code adopted by the City of 
Peoria and amended from time to time” shall be inserted in lieu thereof. 

 
101.3 Appendices.  Amend Section 101.3, “Appendices,” by adding the 
following: 

 
The following appendices are adopted: 
 

APPENDIX A – SIZING AND CAPACITIES OF GAS PIPING 
 
APPENDIX B – SIZING OF VENTING SYSTEMS SERVING 
APPLIANCES EQUIPPED WITH DRAFT HOODS, CATEGORY 1 
APPLIANCES AND  APPPLIANCES LISTED FOR USE WITH TYPE 
B VENTS 
 
APPENDIX C – EXIT TERMINALS OF MECHANICAL DRAFT AND 
DIRECT-VENT VENTING SYSTEMS 

 
Section 103, “Department of Inspection,” is hereby amended as follows: 

 
103.1 General. The Building Safety Division is hereby created and the 
executive official in charge thereof shall be known as the building official. 

 
106 “Permits,” is hereby amended as follows:  

 
106.6.2 Fee Schedule.  Insert the words “Section 2-209 of the Peoria City 
Code, Table 2-209.” 

 
106.6.3 Fee refunds.  Delete in its entirety. 



CHAPTER 5 – BUILDINGS AND BUILDING REGULATIONS 
 

109 Means of Appeal. Delete in its entirety and amend as follows:  “All appeals 
shall follow the provisions of the International Building Code, 2012 Edition, 
Section 113, and Chapter 5 of the Peoria City Code (1992) Section 5-9.” 

 
(2) 404.12 Minimum burial depth. Delete in its entirety and amend as follows: 
“Underground metallic piping systems shall be installed a minimum depth of 12 inches 
(305 mm) below grade. Underground plastic piping systems shall be installed a minimum 
depth of 18 inches (457 mm) below grade.” 

 
404.12.1 Individual outside appliances. Delete in its entirety. 

 
(Ord. 07-32, 10/02/07, Enacted Sec 05-78)  SUPP 2007-4 
(Ord. 2012-08, 5/1/2012, Adopted 2012 Edition) SUPP 2012-2 


